CITY OF MONTGOMERY

PURCHASING DEPT. ABSTRACT OF BIDS
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
City of Montgomery
Bid No. 1 Bid No. 2 Bid No. | 3 Bid No. Bid No. |
Invitation to Bid
10-1115 Concrete _
Date Issued Hodgson Concrete Tuskegee Ready Mix inc No Bids Received
11/14/2014 . )
Small - No Small - Yes Builders Supply; Montgomery
Date Opened Minority - No Minority - Yes Ready Mix
12/11/2014
Requesting Department
Street Maintenance
Terms of Payment/Discount Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Date 24 Hrs ARO As Required
Estimated Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount - Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Fibermesh 500 6.00 3,000.00 3.50 1,750.00
State Mixes A-1A 500 102.00 51,000.00 90.00 45,000.00
State Mixes A-2A 500 . 102.00 '51,000.00 87.50 43,750.00
Flowable Fill 100" 70.00 7,000.00 55.00 5,500.00
Concrete #3000 5000 82.00 410,000.00 70.50 352,500.00
Concrete #4000 1000 87.00 87,000.00 74.50 74,500.00
Concrete #5000 1000 92.00 92,000.00 78.50 78,500.00
Concrete w/1% Cal. Chl. 200 4.00 800.00 3.00 600.00
Concrete w/2% Cal. Chl 500 6.00 3,000.00 6.00 3,000.00
Pumping Price per Cubic Yard 250 No Bid No Bid 2.50 625.00
Retarder 100 3.00 300.00 2.50 250.00
Set-Up Charge for Each Set-Up 8 No Bid No Bid 3.50 28.00
Pozzutech 20 100 7.00 700.00 7.00 700.00
Pea Gyavel 100 No Bid No Bid 5.00 500.00
// ' Fred J. Sippial,
W %/Zz@'« Bobby Hodgson Sr.
S LN /
Exceptions V4 PARTIAL BID None
TOTAL 705,800.00




